
ENR LLMENT(S)
kwiktag ® 103 246 951



COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

NOTICE

D.C. LAW 9-30

"District of Columbia Motor Vehicle Services
Fees Amendment Act of 1991".

Pursuant to Section 412 of the District of Columbia Self-

Government and Governmental Reorganization Act, P. L. 93-198,

"the Act", the Council of the District of Columbia adopted Bill

No. 9-163 on first and second readings, June 4, 1991, and June

18, 1991, respectively. Following the signature of the Mayor

on July 2, 1991, this legislation was assigned Act No. 9-57,

published in the July 12, 1991, edition of the D.C. Register,

(Vol. 38 page 4215) and transmitted to Congress on July 9, 1991

for a 30-day review, in accordance with Section 602(c)(I) of

the Act.

The Council of the District of Columbia hereby gives notice

that this legislation became effective on the date that the

President of the United States signed P. L. 102-105" on August

17, 1991, and therefore, cites this enactment as D.C. Law 9-30,

effective August 17, 1991.

Chairman of the Council

* Public Law 102-105 waived the 30-day Congressional Review
Period for this Law.



AN ACT

Codi fi cati on
District of Columbia Code
(1992 Supplement)

D,C, ACT 9-57

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

JULY 2, 1991

To amend the District of Columbia Revenue Act of 1937; An Act to provide
for the annual inspection of all Motor Vehicles in the District of
Columbia; the District of Columbia Traffic Act of 1925; An Act to
provide for the recording and releasing of liens by entries on
certificates of title for motor vehicles and trailers, and for other
purposes; An Act Making Appropriations to provide for the expense
of the government of the District of Columbia for the fiscal year
ending June thirtieth, nineteen hundred and three, and for other
purposes; the Motor Vehicle Safety Responsibility Act of the District
of Columbia; the Department of Motor Vehicle Regulations for the
District of Columbia, to provide for an increase of certain fees for
services associated with the registration and operation of motor
vehicles in the District of Columbia.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA,
That this act may be cited as the "District of Columbia Motor Vehicle
Services Fees Amendment Act of 1991".

Sec. 2. Title 4 of the District of Columbia Revenue Act of 1937,
approved August 17, 1937 (50 Star. 680; D.C. Code §40-102 e~ seq.),
is amended as follows:

(a) Section 2(d) (D.C. Code §40-102(d)) is amended as follows:
(1) Paragraph (4)(C) is amended to read as follows:

"(C) A fee of $5 shall be paid for each duplicate
registration certificate issued, a fee of $5 shall be paid for each
replacement tag issued, and a fee of $15 shall be paid for each dealer’s
proof of ownership certificate issued; and"; and

(2) Paragraph 5(B) is amended by striking the figure "$5" and
inserting the figure "$10" in its place.

(b) Section 3(b) (D.C. code, sec. 40-104(b)) is amended as follows:
(1) Paragraph (1)(A) is amended by striking the phrase

"Class I (3,499 pounds or less) $45
Class II (3,500 pounds or more) 78"

and inserting the phrase

"Class I (3,499 pounds or less
Class II (3,500 pounds or more)

$55
88"

Section
40-102

Section
40-104



in its place;
(2) Paragraph (4) is amended by striking the figure "$21" and

inserting the figure "$30" in its place;
(3) Paragraph (5) is amended by striking the figure "$6" and

inserting the figure "$10" in its place;
(4) Paragraph (6) is amended by striking the figure "$9" and

inserting the figure "$15" in its place; and
(5) Paragraph (7) is amended by striking the phrase "first set

of tags, $53, and $19 for each additional set" and inserting the phrase
"each set of tags, $53" in its place.

See. 3. Section 1 of An Act To provide for the annual inspection
of all motor vehicles in the District of Columbia, approved February 18,
1938 (52 Star. 78; D.C. Code §40-201), is amended by striking the figure
"$5" and inserting the figure "$10" in its place.

Section
40-201

See. 4. The District of Columbia Traffic Act of 1925, approved
March 3, 1925 (43 Star. 1121; D.C. Code §40-301 et seq.), is amended
as follows :

(a) Section 6 (D.C. Code § 40-703) is amended as follows:          Section
(1) Subsection (b) (D.C. Code §40-703(a)(4)) is amended by 40-703

striking the figure "$30" and inserting the figure "$50" in its place; and
(2) Subsection (d) (D.C. Code §40-703(d)) is amended by

striking the phrase, "and paid such fees for titling and retitling as they
deem necessary, not to exceed the sum of $10 for each such titling or
retitling," and inserting the phrase, "and paid a $20 fee for each titling
and retitling" in its place.

"(b) Section 7 (D.C. Code §40-301) is amended as follows: Section
(1) Subsection (a)(1) is amended by striking the figure "$15" 40-301

and inserting the figure "$20" in its place.
(2) Subsection (a)(2) is amended by striking the figure "$7"

and inserting the figure "$10" in its place."

Sec. 5. Section 5(a) of the Motor Vehicle Safety Responsibility Act
of the District of Columbia, approved May 25, 1954 (68 Star. 122; D.C.
Code §40-405(a)), is amended by striking the figure "$3" and inserting
the figure "$5" in its place.

Section
40-405

See. 6. Section 12 of An Act To provide for the recording and    Section
releasing of liens by entries on certificates of title for motor vehicles and40_1012
trailers, and for other purposes, approved July 2, 1940 (54 Star. 739;
D.C. Code §40-1012), is amended by striking the figure "$1" and
inserting the figure "$15" in its place.

Sec. 7. Section 7(b)(45) of An Act Making Appropriations to
provide for the expenses of the government of the District of Columbia
for the fiscal year ending June thirtieth, nineteen hundred and three,
and for other purposes, approved July 1, 1902 (32 Star. 628; D.C. Code
§47-2842(b)), is amended by striking the phrase "is established at $16"
and inserting the phrase "shall be $50" in its place.

Section
47-2842

See. 8. Title 18 of the District of Columbia Municipal l~egulations
is amended as follows:

18 DCMR
411



Original

(a) Subsection 411.7(d) is amended by striking the phrase
"twenty-five dollars ($25.00)" and inserting the phrase "thirty dollars
($30.00)" in its place;

(b) Subsection 411.8(d)(2) is amended by striking the phrase
"twenty-five dollars ($25.00)" and inserting the phrase "thirty dollars
($30.00)" in its place; and

(c) Subsection 411.8(d)(3) is amended by striking the phras
"twenty-five dollars ($25.00)" and inserting the phrase "thirty dollars
($30.00)" in its place.

Sec. 9. This act shall take effect after a 30-day period of
Congressional review following approval by the Mayor (or in the event
of veto by the Mayor, action b:~ the Council of the District of Columbia
to override the veto) as provided in section 602(c)(1) of the District of
Columbia Self-Government and Governmental Keorganization Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 SLat. 813; D.C. Code §1-233(c)(1)), and
publication in either the District of Columbia Kegister, the District of
Columbia Statutes-at-Large, or the District of Columbia Municipal
Regulations.

Council of the District of Columbia

District of Columbia

APPROVED: July 2, 1991



COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

Council Period Nine

RECORD OF OFFICIAL COUNCIL VOTE
DOCKET NO:

Item on Consent Calendar

~ACTION & DATE: ¯ Adopted First Reading, 06-04-91

VOICE VOTE:
Approved

Recorded vote on request
MasonAbsent:

~ ROLL CALL VOTE: -- RESULT

COUNCIL MEMBER AYE NAY N.V, lAB- COUNCIL MEMBER
CRMN. WILSON JARVIS
B RAZ IL L IGHTFOOT

_CRAWFORD [~LAS ON
CROPP

l
NATHANSON

EVANS RAY
X -- Indicates Vote A.B. -- Absent

AYE NAY    N.V. A.B.

N.V. -- Present, not voting
CERTIFICATION RECORD

:~’ Item on Consent Calendar

~ ACTION & DATE: AdoQted Final

~ VOICE VOTE: Approved

Recorded vote on request

all present
Absent:

~ ROLL CALL VOTE: -- RESULT

COUNCIL MEMBER

Ct-~’J~. WILSON
BRAZIL
CRAWFORD
CROPP
EVANS I

X -- Indicates Vote

AYE NAY N.V. A.B.

B9-163

COUNCIL MEMBER

JARV I S
LIGHTFOOT
MASON
NATHANSON
RAY
A.B. -- Absent

SecretaryTo the Council

~ Item on Consent Calendar

-q ACTION & DATE:

~ VOICE VOTE:
Recorded vote on request

Absent:

~ ROLL CALL VOTE: -- RESULT.

COUNCIL MEMBER AYE NAY N.V, ’A.B,
CIIMN. WILSON
BRAZIL
CRAWFORD
CROPP
EVANS

X -- Indicates Vote

Reading, 06-18-91

AYE NAY NV. A.B

N.V. -- Present, not votin@
CERTIFICATION RECORD

COUNCIL MEMBER
JARVIS

COUNCIL MEMBER AYE NAY , N.V. A.8.

ROLAI~I<
SMITH ,__.JR.

THOMAS ~ SR.

Date

~IGHTFOOT
~SON
NATHANSON
RAY

A.8. -- Absent

COUNCIL MEMBER

ROLARK
SMITH. JR.
THOMAS ~ SR.

AYE NAY

)

Date

COUNCIL MEMBER
ROLARK
SMITH, JR,
THOMAS, SR.

AYE NAY    NV. A.B.

NV. -- Present, not voting
CERTIFICATION RECORD

Secretan/to the Council Date


